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MINUTES OF THE SPECIAL MEETING OF THE 

BOARD OF PUBLIC WORKS AND SAFETY OF THE CITY OF JASPER 

NOVEMBER 26, 2013 

 

 The Board of Public Works and Safety of the City of Jasper, Indiana, met in 

special session on Tuesday, November 26, 2013, in the Council Chambers of City Hall 

located at 610 Main Street.   

 

CALL TO ORDER 

         Presiding Officer Mayor Terry Seitz called the meeting to order at 9:08 a.m.   The 

meeting was advertised for 9:00 a.m. but due to the length of a prior meeting, was called 

to order as soon thereafter. 

 

ROLL CALL 
   Clerk-Treasurer Juanita S. Boehm then called the roll: 

 Mayor Terry Seitz          Present 

 Board member Timothy Bell                      Present  

 Board member David Prechtel         Present 

 

Also present were Police Chief J. Michael Bennett, Street Commissioner 

Raymond Eckerle, City Engineer Chad Hurm, Personnel/Safety/Loss Control Director 

Cale Knies, City Attorney Renee Kabrick and Clerk-Treasurer Juanita Boehm.   

 

Clerk-Treasurer Boehm announced that in order to have a quorum for the 

meeting, a majority of the board members must be present.  All three board members 

were present therefore; there was a quorum for the meeting.   

 

PURPOSE.  Mayor Seitz said the purpose of the special meeting was to open the 2014 

supply bids for the City of Jasper.   

 

ANNUAL SUPPLY BIDS FOR 2014 

  City Attorney Renee Kabrick opened each bid by item number and bidder and 

publicly read each detailed bid.   

 
 

ITEM #1    CRUSHED STONE 

         1-A FOB City stockpile at City Garage, 10,000 tons or less.   

 

Bidder’s Name      Cave Quarries, Inc.           Bidder’s Name  Mulzer Crushed Stone, Inc.                

 Sizes  Price Per Ton        Sizes Price Per Ton 

 23      10.85                                   23                      10.80       

 53      10.85                                              53                       10.80 

 73      10.55                                              73                       10.80                    

             02                          12.25                                              02                       12.25 

             05                          12.25                                              05                       12.25 

             08                          12.55                                              08                       12.65 

             09                          13.55                                              09                       12.80 

            11A                        13.80                                              11A                    13.25 

            11B                        13.80                                              11B                    No Bid 

            12                           14.10                                              12                       14.70 

            Sand                       13.45                                              Sand                   12.55 
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            Rip rap                   14.85                                              Rip-rap               14.05 

            Fill                         No Bid                                            Fill                    No Bid        

                                                                                                  92                       10.00 

 1-B  FOB suppliers stockpile, loaded on City trucks and weighed, 10,000 tons or less.  

 Stockpile location:  Cathy Lane, South Newton Yards, Jasper, IN                    

    

 Bidder’s Name                   Cave Quarries               
 Sizes  Price Per Ton                                               

 23       12.25                                     

             53                           12.25                                              

 73       12.10                                                               

 02       12.75                                            

  05       12.75                                                      

  08       13.00                                            

              09       13.70                                          

              11A                        14.15                                           

             11B                        14.15                                           

 12       14.55                                                      

              Sand       13.45                                          

 Rip-rap       14.15                                                                                                       

 Fill                          No Bid                                             

                                                     

  A motion was made by Mayor Seitz and seconded by Tim Bell to take the bids 

for Item #1, Crushed Stone under advisement.  Motion carried 3-0.   

 
ITEM #2    BITUMINOUS MATERIAL-2013 bid was extended to 2014                                                                

 

Item #3 Bituminous Patching Material 
 

 Patching material, 200 tons or more. 

   Bidder’s Name          Bidder’s Name 

                         Cave Quarries, Inc.          J.H. Rudolph Co., Inc. 
     Price per ton             Price per ton    
 HMA Base, Type A or B     $50.00 FOB Plant                          $53.00  FOB Plant                   

                                              $55.00 Delivered                            $63.00 Delivered                 

HMA Intermediate, Type    

            A or B                         $55.00 FOB Plant                       $56.00 FOB Plant       

                                                $60.00 Delivered                        $66.00 Delivered                      

 

HMA Surface, Type A or B   $59.00 FOB Plant                        $60.00 FOB Plant                   

                                                $64.00 Delivered                         $70.00 Delivered                          

 

High Performance/Cold Mix  $62.50 FOB Plant                        $98.00 FOB Plant                                 

                                                $67.50 Delivered                         $108.00 Delivered 

 

Location of Bidder’s Plant      882 CR 800 E                             12050 Optical Rd. 

                                                Otwell, IN  47564                        English, IN  47118 

                                                                                                     St. Croix Plant                                                                                                                                                                        

INDOT certified Hot Mix  

Asphalt Producer #             # 3154            #3378  

 

            A motion was made by Mayor Seitz and seconded by Tim Bell to take Item #3 

Bituminous Patching Material under advisement.  Motion carried 3-0. 
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Item #4 Concrete Paving Material  

 

Bidders Name  River Town Construction, LLC        
                               Price Per Sq Yard                          

6” thickness                  $52.50                                           

8” thickness                  $63.50                                           

              

A motion was made by Mayor Seitz and seconded by David Prechtel to award bid 

Item #4, Concrete Paving Material to River Town Construction, LLC contingent upon all 

information required is included.  Motion carried 3-0. 

 

 

Item #5      Concrete & Flowable Fill 

FOB to various locations throughout the City limits (50 C.Y. pours or less) 

 

      Bidders Name                     Bidders Name 

                             Central Concrete                      IMI Southwest 

Sizes                               Price Per C.Y.                          Price Per C.Y. 

5 bag mix                              $ 99.00                                    $ 97.00 

5-1/2 bag                               $101.00                                   $ 99.00 

6 bag                                     $103.00                                   $101.00 

3000 PSI                               $ 96.00                                    $ 93.00 

3500 PSI                               $ 98.00                                    $ 95.00 

4000 PSI                               $100.00                                   $ 97.00 

4500 PSI                               $102.00                                   $ 99.50 

Flowable Fill                        $ 66.00                                    $ 65.50 

Calcium Chloride                 2.75/%/cy (as additive)          $   3.00 per % (as additive) 

Low Chloride Accel             4.50/%/cy (as additive)          $   4.00 per % (as additive) 

Winter Heat Charge             $   3.00 /cy                              $   3.00 /cy  

 

Price Per Load                                      Price Per Load                              

Small Load Charge       $55.00                                     Small Load Charge - $40.00 

applies to loads less than 3 CY                                     applies to loads less than 4¼ CY 

 

Fuel Surcharge        depending on fuel prices                      $12.00 per load 

 

      

A motion was made by David Prechtel and seconded by Tim Bell to take Item #5 

Concrete and Flowable Fill under advisement.  Motion carried 3-0.    

 

Item #6  Gasoline,unleaded, 10% Ethanol – All Grades 

Bidder’s Name                            Bidder’s Name                         
Ackerman Oil                                          Synenergy Partners, LLC 

 

Price Per Gallon           Octane                   Price Per Gallon        Octane 

          2.6778                87 Ethanol               2.6305                      87 Ethanol   

          2.8361                89 Ethanol               2.7305                      89 Ethanol 

          2.9945                91 Ethanol               No Bid                      91 Ethanol 

          2.6607                E-85                         No Bid                      E-85 
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 A motion was made by Mayor Seitz and seconded by Tim Bell to award Item #6 

Gasoline Regular Unleaded to Synenergy Partners, LLC.  Motion carried 3-0.  

  

Item #7  Diesel Fuel-Premium Grade-15 PPM Sulfur Fuel-Dyed and Clear  

Premium diesel fuel 25,000 gallons or less delivered to various City Departments.  

Bidder’s Name                     Bidder’s Name 

                                                Ackerman Oil                      Synenergy Partners, LLC 

No 2 Diesel                                         3.1725                       3.2133          

No 2 Winter Blend Diesel                  3.2125                               3.2583                            

Biodiesel B-20                                    No Bid                              No Bid     

Biodiesel B-5                                      3.2845                               No Bid                                

Biodiesel B-5 Winter Blend  No Bid                              No Bid 

Dyed No 2 Diesel                               3.1775                           3.2163          

Dyed No 2 Diesel Winter blend 3.2175                           3.2613 

Dyed Biodiesel B-20                          No Bid                              No Bid 

Dyed Biodiesel B-5                            3.2895                               No Bid 

Dyed Biodiesel B-5 Winter Blend     No Bid                              No Bid 

 

 A motion was made by Tim Bell and seconded by Dave Prechtel to award Item 

#7 Diesel Fuel to Ackerman Oil.  Motion carried 3-0. 

 

Item #8  Supply 500 gallons or more of all grades of gasoline or diesel. FOB supplier 

location. Access to fuel 24 hours per day, every day of the year 

 

Bidder’s Name Bidder’s Name 

        Ackerman Oil         Synenergy Partners, LLC   
Unleaded Ethanol, 87 octane                     2.6778                   2.6305 

Unleaded Ethanol, 89 octane                     2.8361                   2.7305 

Premium Unleaded Ethanol, 91 octane     2.9945                   2.9695 

No. 2 Diesel                                               3.1725                   3.2133 

No. 2 Diesel Fuel, winter blend                 3.2125                   3.2583         

Biodiesel B-5                                             3.2895                   No Bid 

Biodiesel B-5, winter blend                       3.3495                   No Bid 

 

Vehicle card fee, per month                      None                   No Amount 

  

 A motion was made by Mayor Seitz and seconded by David Prechtel to award 

Item #8 to Ackerman Oil because of access in Jasper 24 hours a day.  Motion carried 3-0. 

 

Item #9 Towing of illegally parked and abandoned vehicles 

    Bidder     Bidder 

                       Bob Luegers Motors                   Uebelhor & Sons 
Type of Vehicle                     Price Per Tow                                Price Per Tow 

Cars                    Free                                                 Free 

Cars moved with dolly                Free                                                 Free 

Trucks – under one ton                Free                                                 Free 

Trucks-one ton and over              Free                                                 Free 

 

                                                  Ruxer Ford                            Sternberg Chrysler 
Type of Vehicle                       Price Per Tow                             Price Per Tow 
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Cars                                                  Free                                             Free 

Cars moved with dolly           Free                                            Free 

Trucks – under one ton                    Free                                             Free 

Trucks – one ton and over               Free                                             N/A 

 

 A motion was made by David Prechtel and seconded by Mayor Seitz to award 

Item #9 to all four bidders and use them on a rotating basis.  Motion carried 3-0. 

 

Item #10  Concrete Sidewalk Replacement Program 

     Bidder     

                                River Town Construction, LLC               

                                Thickness     Price per sq ft                      

Man-made Monolithic sidewalk & curb  5"              $4.60                                     

Man-made Sidewalk & Curb    5"              $4.30                                     

Man-made ADA curb ramp                5"               $6.00                                     

Man-made driveway crossing             6"               $5.15  

Man-made Industrial/Commercial      6"              $5.60                           

     driveway crossing 

                                                     Price Per Lin Ft                                                                           

Standard curb & gutter                      $13.00                                  

 

     Bidder 

                                       Ralph Schroering Construction 

         Thickness   Price per sq ft                       

Man-made Monolithic sidewalk & curb    5"              $4.45                                                                           

Man-made Sidewalk & Curb      5"              $3.90         

Man-made ADA curb ramp      5"              $5.95                                                                       

Man-made driveway crossing               6"              $4.95   

Man-made Industrial/Commercial        6"              $5.50                           

     driveway crossing                                                                  

                                                     Price Per Lin Ft                                                                            

Standard curb & gutter                          $12.45                                                             

                                                                                                                                                                       

A motion was made by Tim Bell and seconded by David Prechtel to award Item 

#10 to Ralph Schroering Construction. Motion carried 3-0. 

 

ADJOURNMENT.  There being no further business to come before the board, a motion 

was made by Tim Bell and seconded by David Prechtel to adjourn the meeting. The 

motion carried 3-0 and the meeting adjourned at 9:58 a.m. 

 

The minutes were hereby approved ____with   X   without corrections or 

clarification this 10
th

 day of December, 2013. 

 

     _____________________________    

                                                                         Mayor Terry Seitz 

       Presiding Officer 

Attest: 

 

_______________________________ 

 Juanita S. Boehm, Clerk-Treasurer 


